

1 IREDALE & YOO, APC
EUGENE G. IREDALE (75292)
2 GRACE JUN (287973)
105 W. F Street, Floor 4
3 San Diego, CA 92101
Tel: 619/233-1525
4 619/233-3221 (fax)
egiredale@iredalelaw.com
5 gjun@iredalelaw.com

6 *Plaintiff's Counsel*

7

8

UNITED STATES DISTRICT COURT

9

NORTHERN DISTRICT OF CALIFORNIA – SAN FRANCISCO DIVISION

10

MARY BETH MONTERA, individually and
11 on behalf of all others similarly situated,

12

Plaintiff,

13

v.

14

PREMIER NUTRITION CORPORATION
f/k/a JOINT JUICE, INC.,

15

Defendant.

16

17

18

19

20

21

22

23

24

25

26

27

28

Case No. 3:16-CV-06980 RS

**DECLARATION OF EUGENE G.
IREDALE IN SUPPORT OF PLAINTIFF'S
RENEWED MOTION FOR AWARD OF
ATTORNEYS' FEES AND
REIMBURSEMENT OF NONTAXED
EXPENSES**

CLASS ACTION

Date: May 11, 2023
Time: 1:30 p.m.
Judge: Honorable Richard Seeborg
Courtroom: Courtroom 3, 17th Floor

Complaint Filed: December 5, 2016
Trial Date: May 23, 2022

1 I, EUGENE G. IREDALE, declare:

2 1. I am a principal at the law firm Iredale & Yoo, APC, and an attorney duly licensed
3 to practice before United States Supreme Court, the United States Courts of Appeals for the Ninth
4 and Second Circuits, the United States District Courts for the Southern, Central, Eastern
5 and Northern Districts of California, and the courts of the State of California and Massachusetts. I
6 am Plaintiff's counsel in the above-entitled matter. I have personal knowledge of the matters stated
7 in this declaration except those stated on information and belief, and as to those, I believe them to
8 be true. If called upon, I could and would competently testify to them.

9 2. I submit this declaration in support of Plaintiff's Renewed Motion for an Award of
10 Attorneys' Fees and Reimbursement of Nontaxed Expenses.

11 3. The following is a summary of my education, training, and experience:

12 a. I graduated *magna cum laude* from Columbia College in 1973.

13 b. I graduated *cum laude* from Harvard Law School in 1976.

14 c. I began work at Federal Defenders of San Diego, Inc. as a trial attorney in
15 January 1977. I worked at Federal Defenders for six- and one-half years. From January 1982 to
16 June 1983, I was the Chief Trial Attorney. While at Federal Defenders, I edited the publication,
17 "Defending a Criminal Case," which was distributed to federal defenders and CJA attorneys
18 throughout the United States.

19 d. From July 1, 1983 to the present, I have been engaged in the private
20 practice of law. From 1983 until approximately 1996, I practiced almost exclusively in criminal
21 defense, primarily in federal court. Beginning in approximately 1996, I began to do civil litigation
22 as well, with an emphasis on civil rights and police misconduct litigation under 42 U.S.C. § 1983,
23 the Federal Tort Claims Act, and *Bivens* actions.

24 e. I have tried more than 200 cases to verdict, both civil and criminal, state
25 and federal, in California and throughout the United States. I have argued in the California Court
26 of Appeal, the Ninth and Second Circuits and twice before the United States Supreme Court.

27 f. I am a fellow in the American College of Trial Lawyers, an invitation only
28 fellowship of exceptional trial lawyers.

1 g. I have an AV rating in Martindale-Hubbell.

2 h. I have been recognized in Best Lawyers in America (Naifeh and Smith,
3 2020) in the fields of Criminal Defense, and Criminal Defense – White Collar, and as of August
4 2015, recognized in the field of Civil Rights Litigation.

5 i. I have been listed in the publication, Best Lawyers in America, for over
6 thirty years.

7 j. I have lectured on topics relating to trial practice throughout the United
8 States. This includes a recent lecture for DRI’s 2020 Civil Rights and Governmental Tort Liability
9 program. For more than a decade I taught at the two-week summer trial practice program put on
10 by the National Criminal Defense College, first in Houston and later in Macon, Georgia.

11 k. I have lectured on trial practice for the National Association of Criminal
12 Defense Lawyers (NACDL), the California Attorneys for Criminal Justice (CACJ), the Federal
13 Bar Association, the San Diego County Bar Association, the Federal Public Defenders, the
14 California Public Defender Association, and the National Police Accountability Project.

15 4. I believe that the requested fees and costs are fair and reasonable under controlling
16 law, particularly considering the results realized for the Class.

17 5. In February 2022, my firm associated as trial counsel in this matter. On March 8,
18 2022, Ms. Jun and I filed formal notices of appearance. My firm prosecuted this litigation on a
19 contingent basis with no guarantee of recovery. My firm, along with co-counsel, incurred 100% of
20 the risk in pursuing the litigation. My firm advanced expenses with the understanding that we would
21 be paid a fee and receive reimbursement for expenses only if successful.

22 6. My associate, Grace Jun, and I have been involved in every aspect of the trial from
23 trial preparation to post-trial proceedings. I oversaw each aspect of the trial and had responsibility
24 for overall trial strategy and trial presentation. Ms. Jun and I prepared extensively for trial. This is
25 a complex case. Preparing for trial entailed familiarizing ourselves with the scientific literature and
26 empirical research related to physiology and the efficacy (or lack thereof) of glucosamine and
27 chondroitin; reviewing expert reports and depositions from approximately ten retained experts;
28 reviewing and understanding the underlying data forming the basis of these experts’ opinions;

1 becoming familiar with principles of brand development, marketing, and advertising; reviewing tens
2 of thousands of pages of discovery provided by Premier related to the development of Joint Juice,
3 and the marketing and advertising of Joint Juice; and reviewing the depositions of multiple
4 witnesses, including corporate officials at Premier.

5 7. My firm is composed of two partners, Ms. Yoo and me, one associate, Ms. Jun, one
6 contract attorney, and one legal assistant. Ms. Jun and I had less than three months to prepare for
7 the trial in this matter. Because of the breadth of discovery in this case, and the complexity of the
8 scientific evidence, Ms. Jun and I devoted substantial time to prepare for trial. For this reason, my
9 firm passed on other employment opportunities, and turned down multiple cases, to devote the time
10 and resources necessary to conduct trial in this matter.

11 8. To the extent possible, Ms. Jun and I divided responsibilities according to our relative
12 expertise and experience to minimize duplicate billing or overbilling. For example, Ms. Jun was
13 tasked with reviewing the tens of thousands of pages of corporate documents provided by Premier
14 to create the trial exhibit list and reviewed the deposition transcripts of the witnesses to help prepare
15 the examination of the witnesses at trial. Ms. Jun organized the cross-examination of Premier's
16 corporate officers, prepared impeachment material for use at trial, organized the use of exhibits
17 during witness examinations, and helped prepare the content of the opening statement and closing
18 argument. I conducted juror *voir dire* in this matter. I presented Plaintiffs' opening statement and
19 closing argument. I directed Plaintiffs' primary medical expert witness, Dr. McAlindon, and cross-
20 examined Defendants' medical expert, Dr. Silverman. I cross-examined the corporate officials at
21 Premier Nutrition, including the current CEO of Bell-Ring Brands, Darcy Horn; the former director
22 of marketing, Lance Palumbo; and the founder of Joint Juice, Dr. Kevin Stone.

23 9. Since becoming a licensed attorney in 2012, my associate, Ms. Jun, has assisted me
24 in many cases at trial. As such, she has prepared cases for trial, examined witnesses during trial,
25 prepared jury instructions and verdict forms, and litigated evidentiary issues. Ms. Jun has also been
26 responsible for litigating post-trial motions, interlocutory appeals, appeals after favorable verdicts
27 and judgments, and petitions for *certiorari* made to the United States Supreme Court. In this case,
28 Ms. Jun was responsible for meeting repeatedly with Plaintiffs' expert witnesses to prepare them

1 for trial; preparing Mary Beth Montera, the lead plaintiff, to testify at trial; and conducting three
2 witness examinations at trial.

3 10. The following information regarding my firm's time and out-of-pocket expenses is
4 taken from time and expense records prepared and maintained by the firm in the ordinary course of
5 business. Ms. Jun and I prepared the time records, which are attached to my declaration as Exhibit
6 A. My firm's expense ledger, which records all costs and expenses incurred in this matter, is
7 attached as Exhibit B. I have personally reviewed all attorney time records and expense records.

8 11. I reviewed the time entries in Exhibit A to identify the merits of the work performed
9 and to remove erroneous or duplicative entries. While I believe all the work performed was
10 reasonable, I nonetheless erred on the side of caution and deleted some time billed.

11 12. As a result, I believe that the hours reflected in our fee application are under-
12 inclusive. Further, Ms. Jun and I exercised billing judgment by not entering time that was
13 duplicative, unnecessary, or *de minimis*. Ms. Jun and I exercised our best judgment during litigation
14 to keep our hours as low as reasonably possible.

15 13. The schedule below provides a summary of the hours Ms. Jun and I expended to
16 conduct trial in this case, which are described in greater detail in the timesheets set forth in Exhibit
17 A. I have listed the hourly billing rates, the number of hours expended, the resulting lodestar, and
18 the bar passage year for Ms. Jun and me.

Attorney	Bar Admission	Hours	Rate	Lodestar
Eugene Iredale	1977	354.2	\$1050	\$371,910
Grace Jun	2012	452.6	\$500	\$226,300
TOTALS		806.8		\$598,210

19
20
21
22
23
24
25 14. Ms. Jun and I spent a total number of 806.8 hours on this litigation. Our total lodestar
26 is \$598,210. This lodestar figure is based on our billing rates, which do not include charges for
27 expense items.
28

EXHIBIT A

Detailed time report

Iredale and Yoo, APC

Timeframe	All time	1 Client	Joint Juice
Total	354.20 Hours 354.20 Uninvoiced billable hours	1 Project	Joint Juice (Montera)
		Tasks	All tasks
		1 Team	Eugene Iredale

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
					03/03/2022
					1.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.70
		Meeting with BHO to review case, pleadings, and plan for trial			
					03/08/2022
					2.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Research	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.80
		Begin review of Joint Juice pleadings and motions in companion cases. Mullins MSJ briefs; Sonner appellate briefs and orders			
					03/11/2022
					2.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Research	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
		Continue review of joint juice complaint and class action cert pleadings			
					03/14/2022
					3.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.20
		Review MSJ and pleadings for claims and elements of claims			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.50
		Phone call with possible jury consultant			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.80
		Review Joint Juice opposition to leave to file SAC and appoint new class rep; review declarations and requests for judicial notice			
					Total
					354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
					03/15/2022 3.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.50
	Begin review of plaintiff's and defendant's expert reports (medicine/science) with annotations				
					03/16/2022 1.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.80
	Continue review of expert reports with annotations. Review FDA and FTC guidance and rules				
					03/17/2022 2.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Meeting with BHO team; meeting with Karen Jo Koonan for trial prep				
					03/22/2022 2.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.80
	Read and annotate defendant's Daubert motions to exclude opinions of Guilak, Dennis, Rucker, Weir (ECF 125-128). Review supporting exhibits.				
					03/23/2022 3.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.20
	Read and annotate Daubert motions and exhibits for plaintiff's motion to exclude Grande, Choi, Poret, Steckel, Silverman, Palumbo, and Silverman				
					03/25/2022 1.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.90
	Read and annotate Premier motion to decertify class (ECF 130)				
					03/30/2022 0.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.30
	Read order giving leave to file SAC and substitute class rep (Mary Beth Montera)				
					03/31/2022 4.10
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.30
	Review plaintiff's SAC				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
	Review plaintiff's oppositions to Premier's Daubert motions				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.80
	Review of draft trial demonstratives, demonstratives re: scientific studies on Glucosamine and Chondroitin, timeline of relevant events, research and review of professional organizations glucosamine and chondroitin. Review of draft opening. Examination of marketing material from Joint Juice				
	04/02/2022				2.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Review and annotate Premier's oppositions to Plaintiff's Daubert motions to exclude Poret, Steckel, Stone, Palumbo, Silverman, Grande, Choi (ECF 139-145).				
	04/04/2022				2.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.30
	Meeting at BHO re: trial prep. Discussion with Videotrack about scientific visuals. Review of visuals used in other class action product cases				
	04/08/2022				1.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.40
	Review reply briefs for both plaintiff and defendant related to Daubert motions (ECF 149-159)				
	04/12/2022				5.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.50
	Review Daubert motions and expert reports				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.80
	Review expert depositions with annotations for witness examination				
	04/14/2022				1.00
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
	Review opposition to motion to decertify class, annotate brief and exhibits (ECF 162)				
04/15/2022					4.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.50
	Trial prep. Discuss MILs, pretrial order, witnesses, review of discovery for exhibits with BHO team.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.20
	Continue review of expert reports and depositions				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Communication	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.40
	Conference call with Premier's counsel re MILs and pretrial conference				
04/18/2022					3.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.20
	Review of discovery for exhibits; meeting with BHO team; discussion of MILS				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Communication	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.70
	Review emails with Premier counsel about Premier MILs and possible stipulations. Discussion with BHO				
04/19/2022					1.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.40
	Review of draft plaintiff's supplemental Rule 26 disclosures and Premier's amended disclosures				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.70
	Review draft of opening statement documents - timeline, exhibits, demonstratives				
04/21/2022					1.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.50
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Review drafts of plaintiff's motions in limine			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.20
		Review trial witness list			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.30
		Review memo re: trial			
04/22/2022					2.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
		Meeting with Dr. McAlindon			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Communication	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.30
		Review emails with Premier counsel re MILs and stipulations			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.90
		Review and edit additional plaintiff's motions in limine			
04/23/2022					2.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.30
		Review Premier's motions in limine with notes (ECF 171-177)			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.40
		Review premier's pretrial disclosures			
04/24/2022					5.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	5.20
		Review depositions and document discovery to prepare for witness examinations			
04/25/2022					3.50
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
	Review of juror questionnaire. Draft proposed jury voir dire.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.50
	Review draft jury instructions. Review NY statute, statutory history, and caselaw for GBL 349 and 350				
04/26/2022					6.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.80
	Review draft pretrial statement with notes				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.90
	Read court's order on Daubert motions and order to decertify class (ECF 180). Annotate. Discuss with BHO.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.30
	Meeting at BHO; call with defense counsel				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Review and edit draft jury instructions and caselaw re: GBL in consumer food labeling cases; NY caselaw on disclaimers; FDA regulations				
04/27/2022					2.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.50
	Trial prep meeting with BHO team re: jury instructions and verdict forms. Review and modification of draft forms				
04/28/2022					4.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.60
	Review revised jury instructions re: GBI				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.70
	Make revisions and edits to jury instructions and verdict forms				
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Research	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Read new york pattern jury instruction and annotations for fraud and deceit. Read caselaw cited in annotations				
04/29/2022					3.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.90
	Review Premier's proposed voir dire/written questions. Further edits and changes to plaintiff's proposed voir dire and proposed questions for written questionnaire. Final review and edits.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Communication	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.20
	Review Jessica Grant email re proposed voir dire and discuss with BHO				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Correspondence	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.10
	Swaney email re: verdict forms and proposed instructions				
04/30/2022					5.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.50
	Notes re: Premier's proposed jury instructions, verdict forms, and voir dire (ECF 202-204). Preparation for final pretrial conference				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.70
	Read and notate Premier's oppositions to Plaintiff's motions in limine (ECF 196-201)				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Notes re: plaintiff's oppositions to MILs (ECF 185-191) to prepare for MIL motion hearing				
05/02/2022					2.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.30
	Meeting at BHO re: trial prep (MILs, instructions, verdict forms)				
05/03/2022					6.30
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.70
	Read Premier MIL to exclude untimely witnesses and exhibits (ECF 205)				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Client Communication	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.50
	Phone call with Grace and Mary Beth Montera				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Correspondence	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.30
	Email correspondence (multiple) with Premier counsel re: 10 voir dire questions on written questionnaire. Discussion to see if stipulation possible. Review Premier's proposed questions.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	4.80
	Read depositions of other class plaintiffs (Bland, White, Fishon). Read and annotate McAlindon, Silverman, Grande reports.				
05/04/2022					5.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.50
	Review draft of opp to Premier MIL to exclude untimely witnesses (ECF 205)				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.90
	Read order and parties' briefing on statutory damages and jury instruction in Perez v. Rash, 16-cv-3396-YGR				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Depositions	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.50
	Deposition of Mary Beth Montera				
05/05/2022					6.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	6.00
	(Travel to San Francisco excluded). Review of all motions in limine and pretrial statements; review of NY caselaw. Review and annotate revised joint jury instructions (proposed). Further annotations and review of all proposed jury instructions and verdict forms for plaintiff and defendant. Meeting with Tim Blood.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Correspondence	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.20
	Email correspondence re: Premier proposed questions for written questionnaire				
Total					354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
					05/06/2022 6.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Court	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.50
	Pretrial conference and motion in limine hearing				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Court	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
	Review of pleadings before court and prep for MILs				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.50
	Meeting with Karen Jo Koonan; plan next steps with Grace re: opening statement and examinations				
					05/10/2022 7.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.70
	Meeting with Tommy to prepare for trial re: scientific evidence, studies, clinical trials. Read and annotate scientific literature and studies cited by McAlindon				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	4.10
	Review expert reports and depositions. Begin preparations for Dr. McAlindon direct examination.				
					05/11/2022 5.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.70
	Continue trial prep by reviewing scientific literature and research. Notes re: McAlindon examination. Potential cross of Silverman				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.40
	Begin reading Palumbo deposition Vol. 1 and annotate for clips to use during trial examination				
					05/12/2022 6.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.30
	Preparation for expert witness examination through review of scientific literature, studies				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.90
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Review Palumbo depositions vol. 1 and 2 to annotate and excerpt for clips			
	05/13/2022				4.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.70
		Witness prep with Dr. McAlindon			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.10
		Prep for McAlindon examination through review of expert reports and scientific studies.			
	05/15/2022				5.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	5.40
		Review and mark excerpts for Palumbo deposition Vol. 3. Review designations from Volumes 1 and 2. Finalize all depo designations for Palumbo Vols 1-3. Begin organizing examination of Palumbo.			
	05/17/2022				6.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.80
		Trial prep for Dr. McAlindon examination			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.40
		Review working copy of exhibit binders. Begin annotations and marking of exhibits for use at trial.			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.40
		Review and edit draft of plaintiff's MIL re compliance with FDA regulations. Review FDA regulations			
	05/18/2022				5.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.20
		Continue review of exhibit binders for use at trial. Notes re: McAlindon examination			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
		Review Silverman 2017 deposition transcript. Watch video deposition			
Total					354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.30
	Review draft trial brief				
05/19/2022					6.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.00
	Review and annotate scientific articles marked as demonstratives in working copy of exhibit binders				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.80
	Review notes re Silverman report and depo. Prepare for witness examination				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.20
	Review Plaintiff's opposition to Premier MIL re its alleged omissions (ECF 226); Premier opposition to Plaintiff's MIL re affirmative defense of FDA compliance (ECF 227); and Premier trial brief				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.30
	Review court order on additional MILs (231)				
05/20/2022					9.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	9.70
	Meet and coordinate with Debbie & Grace in San Francisco to prepare for trial. Begin preparations of opening statement and cross-examinations. Begin review of trial binders				
05/21/2022					9.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	9.20
	Meeting with Dr. McAlindon to prepare for direct examination. Review of scientific literature and depositions to prepare for examination. Review exhibits and defense expert depositions				
05/22/2022					9.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	9.50
	Trial prep with Dr. McAlindon. Prepare for opening statement and examination. Prepare for jury voir dire.				
05/23/2022					12.00
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	8.00
	Trial (jury selection and opening statement)				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Prep with Dr. McAlindon; review scientific articles and exhibits for Dr. McAlindon examination				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.30
	Prepare before trial. Review outline of opening statement. Review notes re: voir dire of prospective jurors				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.70
	Review of draft motion for curative instruction on FDA inaction. Discuss, review, and edit draft of MIL to exclude scientific articles				
05/24/2022					12.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	6.00
	Trial (Dr. McAlindon direct exam; matters outside presence of the jury)				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	4.60
	Prepare for examination of Dr. McAlindon and cross examination of Lance Palumbo				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.50
	Prepare before trial - review scientific studies for McAlindon examination				
05/25/2022					12.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	6.00
	Redirect of Dr. McAlindon; examination of Lance Palumbo				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	4.80
	Prepare for Palumbo cross examination and Horn cross.				
Total					354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.60
	Prep before trial: review exhibits and depo excerpts for Palumbo cross examination				
05/26/2022					12.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	6.00
	Palumbo and Horn cross-examination				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	4.90
	Review exhibits and prepare for Horn cross examination. Review deposition and excerpts. View clips.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.70
	Prepare before trial: review of Horn exhibits and depositions for cross examination				
05/27/2022					7.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	6.00
	Horn cross-examination				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.70
	Prep before trial: review of Horn exhibits for examination				
05/28/2022					8.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	8.20
	Review of trial transcripts for week 1. Review of notes re: juror voir dire. Begin review of defense scientific articles and read Stone's book.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.50
	Discussion of exhibit 147 and Rule 104(a) finding.				
05/29/2022					7.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	5.50
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Continue to prepare for Stone cross-examination.			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.50
		Review and edit draft of MIL re: exhibit 147 and FRE 104(a) finding. Discussion and review re: MIL to exclude defense trial exhibits			
	05/30/2022				12.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	10.20
		Review of medical literature and studies cited by defendants. Review of Stone Clinic studies and literature. Review of emails and exhibits related to Stone. Read trial transcripts.			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.80
		Draft review and discussion re MIL that Costco approved Premier's claims re Joint Juice. Discuss and review draft response to Court's jury instructions.			
	05/31/2022				12.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	6.00
		Cross-examine of Dr. Stone			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	4.60
		Prepare for Dr. Silverman cross examination. Continue reviewing defense studies; Stuart expert witness report and depositions; medical literature			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.70
		Prep before trial: review notes regarding cross examination of Stone.			
	06/01/2022				12.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	6.00
		Cross examination of Dr. Stuart Silverman			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Court	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
		Conference with judge re: jury instructions and verdict form			
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.30
	Prepare for Choi cross examination and final review of exhibits for admission				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
	Prepare for Stone examination before trial				
06/02/2022					7.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	4.00
	Cross examine defense expert William Choi				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.90
	Before trial: review notes re Choi cross examination, depo and expert report				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.30
	Review of Court's final jury instructions and verdict forms. Discussion with BHO				
06/03/2022					5.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	5.30
	Read and review trial transcripts to prepare for closing				
06/04/2022					3.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	3.10
	Read trial transcripts				
06/05/2022					10.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	9.30
	Review all admitted exhibits and court transcripts to prepare closing argument. Review depo clip transcripts and demonstrative exhibits to organize closing				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.80
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Review draft objections to final jury instructions and verdict forms. Further discussions with BHO team			
	06/06/2022				10.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	10.50
		Review all admitted exhibits, demonstratives, and court transcripts to prepare closing argument. Review notes and outline			
	06/07/2022				7.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	5.50
		Closing arguments and jury instructions			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.50
		Before trial: review notes and outline for closing			
	06/09/2022				0.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.80
		Review of Premier's JMOL motion (ECF 258); discussion and review of plaintiff's motion for entry of final judgment			
	06/24/2022				0.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.70
		Review and annotate Premier's opposition to Plaintiff's motion for entry of final judgment, including Premier's proposed judgment			
	07/13/2022				0.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.40
		Review Premier's motion to decertify class (ECF 283)			
	07/15/2022				3.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.20
		Zoom motion hearing for motion for entry of final judgment			
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Prep for motion hearing with court. Review notes: Premier JMOL motion, Plaintiff's motion for entry of final judgment. Discussion with BHO team re: motion for entry of final judgment				
	08/12/2022				0.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.40
	Read court order denying premier's motion for JMOL, motion to decertify, and plaintiff's motion for entry of final judgment. Review final judgment				
	08/25/2022				1.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.30
	Edit and revise draft declaration re: attorneys fees and I & Y costs. Review costs and hours.				
	09/12/2022				1.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.40
	Review and annotate Premier's renewed motion for JMOL and motion for new trial. Review trial transcripts related to new trial motion				
	09/22/2022				1.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
	Review draft oppositions to Premier motion for new trial and renewed motion for JMOL. Discuss/confer with BHO				
	10/18/2022				0.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	0.40
	Review court order re: Premier motion for new trial, renewed JMOL motion, and Plaintiff's motion for attorney fees				
	03/15/2023				2.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	2.00
	Read and review motion for leave to file second amended complaint and related exhibits. Review opposition to leave to file SAC, the request for judicial notice with attachments, and Grant's declaration				
	03/18/2023				1.00
				Total	354.20

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	Senior Partner	Eugene Iredale	1.00
		Review plaintiff's reply for leave to file SAC including exhibits			
				Total	354.20

Detailed time report

Iredale and Yoo, APC

Timeframe	All time	1 Client	Joint Juice
Total	452.60 Hours 452.60 Uninvoiced billable hours	1 Project	Joint Juice (Montera)
		Tasks	All tasks
		1 Team	Grace Jun

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
					03/03/2022
					2.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	N/A	Grace Jun	2.00
		Meeting at BHO to review claims, issues, and plan for trial			
					03/07/2022
					0.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Client Communication	N/A	Grace Jun	0.60
		Phone call with Mary Beth to discuss case			
					03/08/2022
					0.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	N/A	Grace Jun	0.10
		Notice of Appearance in Fishon			
					03/14/2022
					0.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Communication	N/A	Grace Jun	0.50
		Conference call with jury consultant			
					03/15/2022
					5.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Client Communication	N/A	Grace Jun	0.80
		Phone interview of Jon Seiger.			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	N/A	Grace Jun	4.40
Total					452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Begin review of pleadings in Fishon and related Joint Juice cases to understand claims. Read class cert motions in Mullins (Sonner). Review Mullins MSJ briefs. Review Seeborg's order re: Mullins MSJ. Read subsequent appellate briefs and orders re: Mullins/Sonner.			
	03/16/2022				3.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	N/A	Grace Jun	3.80
		Continue review of scientific research on claims for Joint Juice. Articles on glucosamine. Review briefs from Mullins/Sonner.			
	03/17/2022				2.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	N/A	Grace Jun	2.00
		Meeting with BHO team to discuss trial; meeting with Karen Jo Koonan to review case and trial presentation			
	03/21/2022				1.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.00
		Review of "hot docs" in discovery			
	03/28/2022				4.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Research	N/A	Grace Jun	4.70
		Research re: presentation of scientific information in other complex product liability cases. Research on damages in class action cases and trial results in class action cases. Review of visuals and presentation of scientific information for jurors.			
	04/01/2022				3.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	N/A	Grace Jun	3.50
		Review allegations of Second Amended Complaint. Begin reviewing Daubert motions by plaintiff and defendant and opposition briefs to understand expert testimony and issues (dkt #s 135-145)			
	04/04/2022				2.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	N/A	Grace Jun	2.30
		Meeting with Videotrack to discuss trial prep, opening statement, visuals. Review opening statements in other product cases.			
	04/05/2022				1.90
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.90
		Read McAlindon's report and annotate. Questions and issues on presentation of science.			
04/08/2022					2.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.50
		Research on false advertising claims. Review summary judgment briefs and evidence from Mullins to review nature of claims and evidence			
04/11/2022					3.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.50
		Discussion re: proposed jury voir dire			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.30
		Begin review of discovery and "hot docs" to determine trial exhibits and order of exhibits			
04/12/2022					4.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	4.10
		Review discovery for chronology of events. Review chronology of scientific studies and evolving scientific consensus re: glucosamine			
04/13/2022					3.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.20
		Review depo transcripts of Fishon; McAlindon. Review of types of questions posed by opposing counsel			
04/14/2022					1.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Research	N/A	Grace Jun	1.00
		Read Yee Ting Lau v. Pret a Manager. Research class action false advertising claims in Ninth Circuit			
04/15/2022					3.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.50
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Trial prep meeting then meet/confer with defense counsel. Begin designating trial exhibits			
	04/18/2022				7.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	7.10
	Trial prep review of discovery for trial exhibits. Review of "hot docs" and discovery index. Annotate and outline. Questions on corporate structure and evolution of Joint Juice. Review of ads and marketing brochures.				
	04/19/2022				6.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	5.30
	Review discovery for trial exhibits, work on editing and refining exhibits and exhibit list for trial				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.50
	Meeting with Dr. McAlindon for trial prep				
	04/20/2022				6.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	6.60
	Work on exhibits and exhibit list. Meeting with Tommy & Craig to discuss. Discussion re: plaintiff's motions in limine				
	04/21/2022				4.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Court	N/A	Grace Jun	4.00
	Daubert motion hearing preparation, review of Daubert motions. Attended Daubert motion hearing (Zoom)				
	04/22/2022				6.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.50
	Re-organize trial exhibits, make chronological, separate ads from corporate documents				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.50
	Trial prep Dr. McAlindon				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Pleadings	N/A	Grace Jun	1.40
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Draft motion in limine to exclude anecdotal evidence of Joint Juice efficacy and patient satisfaction (by Stone and Silverman)			
	04/23/2022				4.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	4.20
		Review discovery for trial exhibits. Possible impeachment exhibits. Review sequence and chronology of exhibits			
	04/24/2022				8.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	8.00
		Continue review of discovery, revision of possible exhibits, amend exhibit list			
	04/25/2022				5.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.60
		Trial prep meeting. Exhibits, discussion of science and Daubert			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Client Communication	N/A	Grace Jun	0.20
		Email correspondence with Mary Beth Montera re deposition			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.20
		Review Premier's motions in limine (dkt #s 171-77). Notes with questions for BHO team.			
	04/26/2022				6.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.50
		Meeting at BHO, meet/confer with defense counsel re trial			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	4.30
		Amend exhibit list and make edits/revisions to chronology			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Client Communication	N/A	Grace Jun	0.20
		Email with Mary Beth			
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.90
	Review Court's Daubert order (no. 180). Notations to review with Craig and Tommy.				
04/27/2022					6.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	5.80
	Jury instructions and verdict form meeting at BHO. Continue refining and reorganizing trial exhibits, review of exhibits marked for identification (scientific studies)				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Client Communication	N/A	Grace Jun	0.20
	Email with Mary Beth				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.40
	Upload exhibits to Videotrack. Discussion with Debbie about trial exhibit binders and marking exhibits				
04/28/2022					7.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Client Communication	N/A	Grace Jun	1.30
	Depo prep of Mary Beth Montera				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	5.80
	Meeting re trial prep; jury instructions and verdict form. Continue and revisions regarding proposed instructions and verdict forms. Changes to formatting and language. Review edits to plaintiff's proposed instructions and verdict forms. Review of GBL 349 and 350 legislative history, NY caselaw. Provide research notes to Gene.				
04/29/2022					6.30
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Correspondence	N/A	Grace Jun	0.20
	Review emails from defense counsel re: proposed jury instructions and verdict forms				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.90
	Plaintiff's proposed voir dire based on notes of discussion with Karen Jo. Review Premier's proposed voir dire. Draft of possible questions for written questionnaire				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.50
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
	Background research on Dr. Stone.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.70
	Review notes from Fishon deposition to prep Mary Beth. Research on responsibilities of class rep. Research re: NY stores & Joint Juice				
05/01/2022					3.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.70
	Review Premier's oppositions to plaintiff's motions in limine (dkt. 196-201). Review Premier's proposed jury instructions, voir dire, verdict forms. (202-204). Notate and highlight issues for discussion. Research re verdict forms.				
05/02/2022					6.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	4.00
	Trial prep. Prep for Mary Beth deposition. Review of Mary Beth's discovery responses. Review other plaintiff depositions in sister Joint Juice cases				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.10
	Red eye flight, SAN to JFK				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Correspondence	N/A	Grace Jun	0.20
	Email with defense counsel re: witness availability and schedules				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.30
	Meeting at BHO to discuss MILS, instructions, verdict forms				
05/03/2022					8.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	N/A	Grace Jun	3.70
	Meeting with Mary Beth to discuss facts of case, her deposition, trial, and trial testimony.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	4.80
	Review of plaintiffs' depositions in other Joint Juice class actions. Preparation for Mary Beth deposition testimony and trial testimony.				
05/04/2022					6.00
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Depositions	N/A	Grace Jun	6.00
	Meeting with Mary Beth before and after deposition to prep for deposition and begin trial prep. Mary Beth's deposition (3.5 hours)				
05/05/2022					6.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.10
	Travel to SFO from JFK for pretrial conference and MIL hearing				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.70
	Review of revised joint jury instructions. Research on GBL instructions and verdict forms out of SDNY, EDNY				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.80
	Review of Premier exhibits related to customer testimonials				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.00
	Preparation for MIL hearing and final pretrial conference. Read MILs and oppositions, notate juror questionnaire and propose voir dire.				
05/06/2022					5.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Court	N/A	Grace Jun	2.50
	MIL hearing and pretrial conference				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	N/A	Grace Jun	2.50
	Meeting with Karen Jo Koonan to discuss case and trial				
05/08/2022					5.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	5.00
	Review discovery related to corporate marketing ("marketing decks") sales data for Joint Juice, purchase of Joint Juice by Premier.				
05/09/2022					6.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	6.70
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Refine, organize, mark trial exhibits. Begin planning order of witness testimony and compile notes on examination of corporate/marketing individuals			
	05/10/2022				6.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	6.60
		Review and marking of exhibits			
	05/11/2022				9.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	9.20
		Finalize exhibits to send to Debbie for bates numbering. Worked with Debbie re: electronic exhibit sticker			
	05/12/2022				8.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	7.80
		Review exhibits. Review depositions for depo designations. Begin review of Rucker expert report and deposition. Review Poret and Dennis expert reports.			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.00
		Trial prep with Dr. Rucker			
	05/13/2022				8.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.10
		Simultaneous electronic exchange of trial exhibits			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	8.40
		Review of defense exhibits. Review of exhibits related to claims substantiation. Review depositions for trial (Horn) and depo designations from Horn Volume 1 for excerpts/clips. Send depo excerpts to Videotrack.			
	05/14/2022				9.20
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	9.20
		Review Horn Vol. 2 deposition and Ritterbush deposition. Make designations for excerpts/clips from Horn and Ritterbush depositions (Ritterbush possibly in lieu of live testimony). Outline of witness examination (corporate structure, marketing, rebranding, packaging). Begin separating out exhibits to be used/admitted by each witness			
	05/15/2022				8.70
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	8.70
	Read Stirtz depositions (30b1 and 30b6) and Cornille deposition. Make excerpts from both designations, possibly to play in lieu of testimony. Also possible impeachment clips. Review Palumbo deposition and amend list of clips/excerpts for use at trial.				
	05/16/2022				9.10
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	9.10
	Prep for witness examinations (Palumbo), review of exhibits for witness examination, and organization of exhibits by witness.				
	05/17/2022				9.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	8.10
	Review all trial exhibits. Meet/confer re trial exhibits. Continue witness examination prep				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.80
	Organize notes of Rucker examination. Trial prep with Derek Rucker for his witness examination				
	05/18/2022				9.40
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	9.40
	Prepare for Palumbo & Horn witness examinations through review of depo testimony and exhibits. Review discovery for impeachment exhibits				
	05/19/2022				8.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	8.80
	Exhibits and witness examination prep. Begin organizing witness examinations of Horn and Palumbo with exhibits and depo clips.				
	05/20/2022				10.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	10.00
	Travel to courtroom to set up electronic equipment for trial. Review of exhibit binders. Review of Dennis and Rucker expert reports				
	05/21/2022				12.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	12.00
Total					452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
	Horn & Palumbo deposition designations for cross-examination. Review exhibits for exhibits to use with Horn and Palumbo. Meet with Mike Dennis for testimony prep				
	05/22/2022				13.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	13.00
	Draft and prepare opening statement Powerpoint. Create draft for Gene to review and read				
	05/23/2022				12.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	8.00
	Jury selection and opening statements				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	4.80
	Prep for Palumbo examination. Begin compiling all exhibits and deposition clips for cross. Annotate exhibits and draft memo for EGI				
	05/24/2022				12.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	6.00
	Day 2 witness examination (Dr. McAlindon)				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	6.50
	Continue preparations for Palumbo examination; organize exhibits for use and admission through Palumbo. Organize exhibits to admit with Darcy Horn				
	05/25/2022				12.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	6.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	5.70
	Prepare exhibits and documents for Horn cross examination. Organize exhibits and sequence deposition excerpts with exhibits. Memo for Gene.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.00
	Confer with EGI re Palumbo cross examination before trial				
	05/26/2022				12.00
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	6.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	5.30
	Prepare for Rucker examination. Confer with Gene re: Horn examination and exhibits. Review trial transcripts for Day 1 and annotate opening statements.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.70
	Discussion with Derek Rucker about admitted exhibits re: advertising and use of exhibits during testimony				
05/27/2022					9.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	6.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.00
	Prep Mary Beth Montera for trial testimony. Review her deposition. Mock examination and cross.				
05/28/2022					3.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.00
	Review trial transcript for first week. Begin review of admitted exhibits. Outline closing.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.80
	Discussion with BHO about motion to exclude portions of defense exhibits 525, 526, and 564 to eliminate reference to scientific studies. Draft of declaration				
05/29/2022					11.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	4.60
	Review of depo designations (Cornille, Stirtz, Ritterbush, Irving) to determine what to play during trial. Revise depo designations and Word document of clip transcripts. Finalize depo designations for witnesses and send to Premier counsel				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	7.30
	Begin preparations for Stone cross examination. Identify and segregate exhibits for use with Stone. Review emails and Stone Clinic studies. Review discovery for impeachment material. Identify additional items to mark as new exhibits next in line.				
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
	05/30/2022				10.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.00
	Email from Jessica Grant. Reviewed Premier's designations for Ritterbush. Revised clip transcripts with both parties' designations and sent to all counsel.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.30
	Finalize depo designations. Pare down to Stirtz 30(b)(6) depo. Send to Premier counsel to obtain final approval on depo designations. Sent final depo clips to Premier after clips are made by Videotrack.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.40
	Mark additional items as new exhibits for Stone examination; provide copy to Premier.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.00
	Discussion re Premier opposition to Plaintiff's MIL re: FRE 104(a) for trial exhibit 147				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.80
	Finalize exhibits and material for Gene's use in Stone cross examination. Copies from Stone's book.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.30
	Review and mark Colin Weir's supplemental Rule 26 report as identification exhibit; send to Premier counsel				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	2.00
	Annotations of trial transcripts for use in closing: defense opening statement; Palumbo & Horn testimony; admitted exhibits				
	05/31/2022				11.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	6.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.50
	Review of court's draft of verdict form and jury instructions. Confer with BHO re: revisions and changes to court's versions.				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.20
Total					452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
		Review defendant's exhibits 751, 752, 758, 759, demonstrative/study at 753			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	3.20
		Review Imes deposition. Review Costco correspondence and substantiation claims. Review defense exhibits related to Costco and substantiation			
	06/01/2022				11.70
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	6.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	0.90
		Send electronic copy of exhibit 493 (admitted through Stone cross examination). Request electronic copies of exhibits admitted through Donna Imes. Review defense exhibits 755, 756, and 757			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	4.80
		Review of Poret depo transcripts for clip designations and excerpts. Prep re: Poret and Choi cross examinations			
	06/02/2022				7.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	4.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Correspondence	N/A	Grace Jun	0.20
		Email string courtroom deputy and defense counsel regarding time estimates for closing			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Correspondence	N/A	Grace Jun	0.20
		Email with courtroom deputy and defense counsel regarding timing of closing argument and length of jury instructions			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.30
		Review court's verdict form and instructions (dkt # 259). Confer with EGI, BHO. Discuss plaintiff's proposed changes and responses.			
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	1.90
		Read trial transcripts to review testimony			
	06/03/2022				6.30
				Total	452.60

Client	Project	Task	Roles	Person	Hours
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	6.30
	Review of trial transcripts and admitted exhibits. Begin drafting closing argument with call-outs to trial testimony and admitted exhibits. Coordinate with Debbie re: mock-ups of Joint Juice packaging				
06/04/2022					7.60
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	7.60
	Continue drafting outline of closing argument based on testimony and admitted exhibits				
06/05/2022					8.80
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	8.80
	Preparation of closing argument slides for marketing, packaging, branding using testimony and exhibits. Confer re: closing argument. Draft outline and circulate among trial team				
06/06/2022					10.90
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial Preparation	N/A	Grace Jun	10.90
	Prepare rebuttal closing. Discussion re: use of verdict form at closing. Review of scientific literature for call-outs during closing				
06/07/2022					5.50
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	5.50
	Closing arguments and jury instructions				
06/08/2022					5.00
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Meeting	N/A	Grace Jun	1.00
	Meeting with Karen Jo Koonan, Tim, Mary Beth Montera for post trial debrief				
Joint Juice	Joint Juice (Montera)	Trial	N/A	Grace Jun	4.00
	Break down war room by organizing all binders and trial material. Segregate binders and trial material important for post-trial proceedings. Organize for post-trial motions. Prepare binders for shipment back to San Diego.				
				Total	452.60

EXHIBIT B

2:39 PM

01/16/23

Accrual Basis

Iredale & Yoo
Transaction Detail By Account

All Transactions

Type	Date	Name	Source Name	Memo	Debit	Credit	Balance
Case Related Costs							
Outside Consultants							
Transcription							
Bill	05/13/2022	Joint Juice	Veritext	5/13/22 Transcript Services/Depositions	865.40		-865.40
Bill	06/13/2022	Joint Juice	Veritext	6/13/22 Video Services/Depositions	466.30		-1,331.70
Total Transcription					1,331.70	0.00	-1,331.70
Total Outside Consultants					1,331.70	0.00	-1,331.70
Total Case Related Costs					1,331.70	0.00	-1,331.70
Business License & Fees							
Credit ...	06/24/2022	Joint Juice	California State Bar	Joint Juice: Certificate of Standing for Gr...	25.00		-25.00
Credit ...	06/24/2022	Joint Juice	California State Bar	Joint Juice: Certificate of Standing for Gr...	0.63		-25.63
Total Business License & Fees					25.63	0.00	-25.63
court fees							
Credit ...	03/10/2022	Joint Juice	One Legal	Efiling Complaint Bland VS Premier Nutri...	19.51		-19.51
Credit ...	03/10/2022	Joint Juice	One Legal	Efiling Complaint Sonner VS Premier Nut...	19.51		-39.02
Total court fees					39.02	0.00	-39.02
Postage and Delivery							
Credit ...	05/08/2022	Joint Juice	FedEx	Printing items for final pretrial conference	20.75		-20.75
Credit ...	05/08/2022	Joint Juice	FedEx	Printing items for final pretrial conference	79.78		-100.53
Total Postage and Delivery					100.53	0.00	-100.53
Travel & Entertainment							
Meals							
Credit ...	05/06/2022	Joint Juice	The Counter	SFO for Joint Juice	71.88		-71.88
Credit ...	05/08/2022	Joint Juice	Zuni Cafe San Francisco	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	349.54		-421.42
Credit ...	05/24/2022	Joint Juice	The Chieftain Irish Pub	SFO for Joint Juice	147.89		-569.31
Credit ...	06/05/2022	Joint Juice	Zuni Cafe San Francisco	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	274.54		-843.85
Total Meals					843.85	0.00	-843.85
Travel							
Credit ...	04/10/2022	Joint Juice	Southwest Airlines	travel to San Francisco Joint Juice	270.97		-270.97
Credit ...	04/10/2022	Joint Juice	Southwest Airlines	travel to San Francisco Joint Juice	11.20		-282.17
Credit ...	04/28/2022	Joint Juice	Jet Blue	travel to SF for Joint Juice case	448.60		-730.77
Credit ...	05/02/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	379.21		-1,109.98
Credit ...	05/02/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	14.99		-1,124.97
Credit ...	05/02/2022	Joint Juice	Hotels.com	Grace trip to NY for Joint Juice	585.31		-1,710.28
Credit ...	05/03/2022	Joint Juice	Lyft	Grace trip to NY for Joint Juice	16.79		-1,727.07
Credit ...	05/04/2022	Joint Juice	Curb Service Queens NY	Grace trip to NY for Joint Juice	78.88		-1,805.95
Credit ...	05/05/2022	Joint Juice	Curb Service Queens NY	Grace trip to NY for Joint Juice	74.22		-1,880.17
Credit ...	05/05/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	70.00		-1,950.17
Credit ...	05/05/2022	Joint Juice	Riu Plaza NY Times Square	New York travel for Joint Juice	245.45		-2,195.62
Credit ...	05/06/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	14.91		-2,210.53
Credit ...	05/06/2022	Joint Juice	Southwest Airlines	SFO for Joint Juice		11.20	-2,199.33
Credit ...	05/07/2022	Joint Juice	Marriott	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	252.02		-2,451.35
Credit ...	05/08/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...		70.00	-2,381.35
Credit ...	05/08/2022	Joint Juice	Marriott	SFO for Joint Juice	247.02		-2,628.37
Credit ...	05/08/2022	Joint Juice	Riu Plaza NY Times Square	New York travel for Joint Juice	29.90		-2,658.27
Credit ...	05/09/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	48.08		-2,706.35
Credit ...	05/11/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	47.98		-2,754.33
Credit ...	05/11/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	330.20		-3,084.53
Credit ...	05/11/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	44.98		-3,129.51
Credit ...	05/11/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	297.20		-3,426.71
Credit ...	05/11/2022	Joint Juice	Southwest Airlines	SFO for Joint Juice	15.00		-3,441.71
Credit ...	05/13/2022	Joint Juice	Southwest Airlines	SFO for Joint Juice		15.00	-3,426.71
Credit ...	05/13/2022	Joint Juice	Southwest Airlines	SFO for Joint Juice	135.00		-3,561.71
Credit ...	05/20/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	35.66		-3,597.37
Credit ...	05/20/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	30.00		-3,627.37
Credit ...	05/21/2022	Joint Juice	Intercontinental SF	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	9,640.20		-13,267.57
Credit ...	05/21/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	40.00		-13,307.57
Credit ...	05/22/2022	Joint Juice	Lyft	SFO for Joint Juice	11.77		-13,319.34
Credit ...	05/22/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	200.00		-13,519.34
Credit ...	05/22/2022	Joint Juice	Lyft	SFO for Joint Juice	13.66		-13,533.00
Credit ...	05/22/2022	Joint Juice	Fog City Cab SF	SFO for Joint Juice	59.70		-13,592.70
Credit ...	05/22/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	6.82		-13,599.52
Credit ...	05/22/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	16.67		-13,616.19
Credit ...	05/22/2022	Joint Juice	Intercontinental SF	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	441.39		-14,057.58
Credit ...	05/23/2022	Joint Juice	Intercontinental SF	SFO for Joint Juice	308.64		-14,366.22
Credit ...	05/23/2022	Joint Juice	Lyft	SFO for Joint Juice	10.68		-14,376.90
Credit ...	05/23/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	15.58		-14,392.48
Credit ...	05/23/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	5.00		-14,397.48
Credit ...	05/24/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	10.03		-14,407.51
Credit ...	05/24/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.49		-14,420.00
Credit ...	05/24/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	3.00		-14,423.00
Credit ...	05/25/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.08		-14,435.08
Credit ...	05/25/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	1.00		-14,436.08
Credit ...	05/25/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	14.33		-14,450.41
Credit ...	05/25/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	11.16		-14,461.57
Credit ...	05/26/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	3.00		-14,464.57
Credit ...	05/26/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	10.20		-14,474.77
Credit ...	05/26/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	13.09		-14,487.86
Credit ...	05/27/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	21.66		-14,509.52
Credit ...	05/27/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	100.00		-14,609.52
Credit ...	05/27/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	11.72		-14,621.24

2:39 PM

01/16/23

Accrual Basis

Iredale & Yoo
Transaction Detail By Account

All Transactions

Type	Date	Name	Source Name	Memo	Debit	Credit	Balance
Credit ...	05/27/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	21.35		-14,642.59
Credit ...	05/29/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	18.35		-14,660.94
Credit ...	05/29/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	11.20		-14,672.14
Credit ...	05/29/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	1.00		-14,673.14
Credit ...	05/29/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	15.21		-14,688.35
Credit ...	05/30/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	3.00		-14,691.35
Credit ...	05/30/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	10.00		-14,701.35
Credit ...	05/31/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	11.75		-14,713.10
Credit ...	06/01/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.01		-14,725.11
Credit ...	06/01/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.07		-14,737.18
Credit ...	06/01/2022	Joint Juice	Intercontinental SF	SFO for Joint Juice	905.72		-15,642.90
Credit ...	06/01/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	1.00		-15,643.90
Credit ...	06/02/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	3.00		-15,646.90
Credit ...	06/02/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.10		-15,659.00
Credit ...	06/02/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	15.00		-15,674.00
Credit ...	06/03/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	13.15		-15,687.15
Credit ...	06/03/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	1.00		-15,688.15
Credit ...	06/03/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.31		-15,700.46
Credit ...	06/03/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	170.00		-15,870.46
Credit ...	06/03/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	16.99		-15,887.45
Credit ...	06/05/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.91		-15,900.36
Credit ...	06/05/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.35		-15,912.71
Credit ...	06/05/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	14.27		-15,926.98
Credit ...	06/05/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	12.31		-15,939.29
Credit ...	06/07/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	1.00		-15,940.29
Credit ...	06/07/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	14.14		-15,954.43
Credit ...	06/07/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	15.83		-15,970.26
Credit ...	06/08/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	100.00		-16,070.26
Credit ...	06/08/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	19.00		-16,089.26
Credit ...	06/08/2022	Joint Juice	Alaska Air	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	70.00		-16,159.26
Credit ...	06/08/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...	36.41		-16,195.67
Credit ...	06/08/2022	Joint Juice	Intercontinental SF	SFO for Joint Juice EUGENE G IREDAL...		266.20	-15,929.47
Credit ...	06/09/2022	Joint Juice	Lyft	SFO for Joint Juice	10.99		-15,940.46
Credit ...	06/10/2022	Joint Juice	Intercontinental SF	SFO for Joint Juice	1,000.00		-16,940.46
Credit ...	06/10/2022	Joint Juice	Uber	SFO for Joint Juice	40.89		-16,981.35
Credit ...	06/10/2022	Joint Juice	Intercontinental SF	SFO for Joint Juice	1,000.00		-17,981.35
Bill	07/06/2022	Joint Juice	Grace Jun-	Intercontinental Hotel - Joint Juice	5,067.07		-23,048.42
Total Travel					23,410.82	362.40	-23,048.42
Total Travel & Entertainment					24,254.67	362.40	-23,892.27
TOTAL					25,751.55	362.40	-25,389.15

1
2
3
4
5
6
7
8
9
10
11
12
13
14
15
16
17
18
19
20
21
22
23
24
25
26
27
28

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I hereby certify that on April 4, 2023, I electronically filed the foregoing with the Clerk of the Court using the CM/ECF system which will send notification of such filing to the e-mail addresses denoted on the Electronic Mail Notice List, and I hereby certify that I have mailed the foregoing document or paper via the United States Postal Service to the non-CM/ECF participants indicated on the Electronic Mail Notice List.

Executed on April 4, 2023.

s/ Timothy G. Blood

TIMOTHY G. BLOOD

BLOOD HURST & O'REARDON, LLP
501 West Broadway, Suite 1490
San Diego, CA 92101
Tel: 619/338-1100
619/338-1101 (fax)
tblood@bholaw.com